MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP A - CAST COUPLINGS, REPAIR CLAMPS, STAINLESS STEE TAPPING SLEEVES & BELL JOINT CLAMPS
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION onit | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
COUPLINGS BOLTED
103003-1-3 3" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-1-4 4" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-1-6 6" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea. 50 109.00 $5,450.00 $0.00 $165.00 $8,250.00 $0.00 $0.00
103003-1-8 8" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-1-10 10" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-1-12 12" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-1-16 16" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-112-0 20" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-112-4 24" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-113-0 30" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
103003-113-6 36" LONG COUPLING (Length 7 1/2") Ea.
COUPLINGS BOLTED (LONG)
103003-1-24 4" LONG COUPLING (Length 11") Ea.
103003-1-26 6" LONG COUPLING (Length 11") Ea.
103003-1-28 8” LONG COUPLING (Length 11") Ea.
103003-1-210 10” LONG COUPLING (Length 12") Ea.
103003-1-212 12” LONG COUPLING (Length 12") Ea.
TRANSITIONAL COUPLINGS
103003-2-4 4" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
103003-2-6 6" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
103003-2-8 8" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
103003-2-10 10" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
103003-2-12 12" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
103003-2-13 30" TRANSITIONAL COUPLING Ea.
COUPLINGS HY-MAX OVERSIZED MAINS
103005-1-4 4" (4.25-5.63) Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103005-1-6 6" (6.42-7.68) Ea.
103005-1-8 8" (8.54-9.84) Ea.
103005-1-10  |10" (10.7-12.0) Ea.
103005-1-12 12" (12.4-13.66) Ea.
103021-1-1 4" ALPHA XL (4.80 - 5.10) CAP Ea.
103021-1-2 6" ALPHA XL (6.90 - 7.20) CAP Ea.
103021-1-3 8" ALPHA XL (9.10 - 9.40) CAP Ea.
103021-1-4 4" X 12" ALPHA XL (4.80 - 5.10) COUPLING Ea.
103021-1-5 6" X 12" ALPHA XL (6.90 - 7.20) COUPLING Ea. 30 520.00 $15,600.00 $538.75 $16,162.50 $485.00 $14,550.00 $0.00
103021-1-6 8" X 12" ALPHA XL (9.10 - 9.40) COOUPLING Ea. 10 680.00 $6,800.00 $695.80 $6,958.00 $627.00 $6,270.00 $0.00
103021-1-11 8" X 12" ALPHA XL (9.10 - 9.40) COOUPLING Ea.
139002-8-1 6" X 11" HYMAX VERSA COUPLING (6.42 - 7.68) Ea.
139002-8-9 6" (6.50 - 7.20) HYMAX GRIP Coupling Ea. 5 410.00 $2,050.00 $410.75 $2,053.75 $406.00 $2,030.00 $0.00
139002-8-10 8" (8.50 - 9.40) HYMAX GRIP Coupling Ea. 3 530.00 $1,590.00 $530.50 $1,591.50 $525.00 $1,575.00 $0.00
SEWER COUPLINGS
103002-7-9 2" PLASTIC X 2" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-10 3" X 2" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-11  |3" X 4" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-13  |4" CI PLASTIC X 4" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-14  |4" CLAY X 4" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-15  |4" CI PLASTIC X 4" CONCRETE Ea.
103002-7-16  |4" ASBESTOS DI X 4" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-33  |4" CLAY X 4" CLAY Ea.
103002-7-12 6" CI PLASTIC X 4" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-17 6" CI PLASTIC X 6" Cl PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-18 6" CLAY X 6" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-19  |6" CI PLASTIC X 6" CONCRETE Fa.
103002-7-20 6" ASBESTOS DI X 6" CI PLASTIC Fa.
103002-7-34 6" CIAY X 4" CI PLASTIC Fa.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-7-8 6" PLASTIC X 8" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-47 8" CLAY X 6" ClI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-21 8" CI PLASTIC X 8" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-22 8" CLAY X 8" ClI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-23 8" CI PLASTIC X 8" CONCRETE Ea.
103002-7-24 8" ASBESTOS DI X 8" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-25 10" CI PLASTIC X 10" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-26 10" CLAY X 10" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-27 10" CI PLASTIC X 10" CONCRETE Ea.
103002-7-28 10" ASBESTOS DI X 10" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-29 12" CI PLASTIC X 12" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-30 12" CLAY X 12" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-31 12" CI PLASTIC X 12" CONCRETE Ea.
103002-7-32 12" ASBESTOS DI X 12" CI PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-50 15" PLASTIC X 15" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-51 15" CLAY X 15" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-52 18" PIASTIC X 18" PLASTIC Ea.
103002-7-53 24" PLASTIC X 24" PLASTIC Ea.
HYMAX VERSA COUPLINGS
139002-8-4 4" (4.40-5.10) 11" Length Ea.
139002-8-1 6" (6.42 - 7.68) 11" Length Ea.
139002-8-2 8" (8.54-9.84) 11" Length Ea.
139002-8-3 12" (12.58 - 13.84) 11" Length Ea.
ALPHA ROMAC CAPS XL
103021-1-1 4" Ea.
103021-1-2 6" Ea.
103021-1-3 8" Ea.
103021-1-7 10" Ea.
103021-1-8 12" Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP.

CORE & MAIN

EJ PRESCOTT

F. W. WEBB COMPANY

ALPHA ROMAC COUPLINGS

103021-1-4 4" Ea.
103021-1-5 6" Ea.
103021-1-6 8" Ea.
103021-1-9 10" Ea.
103021-1-10 12" Ea.

GROUP A - SUB TOTAL

$31,490.00

$26,765.75

$32,675.00

NO BID
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP B - COPPER TUBING (DS - 5)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION onit | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)

103001-2-1 3/4" TYPE K COPPER TUBING Ft. 1200 6.00 $7,200.00 $5.75 $6,900.00 $5.25 $6,300.00 $4.93 $5,916.00
103001-2-2 1" TYPE K COPPER TUBING Ft.
103001-2-4 1-1/2" TYPE K COPPER TUBING Ft.
103001-2-5 2" TYPE K COPPER TUBING Ft.

GROUP B - SUB TOTAL $7,200.00 $6,900.00 $6,300.00 $5,916.00
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP C - BRASS SERVICE FITTINGS (CURB BOX, CURB STOPS, CONNECTORS) (PAGE DS - 5)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION onit | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103002-14-1 3/4" COUPLING- COPPER X COPPER Ea.
103002-14-2 1" COUPLING- COPPER X COPPER Ea.
103002-14-3 1-1/2" COUPLING- COPPER X COPPER Ea.
103002-14-4 2" COUPLING- COPPER X COPPER Ea.
103002-14-5 1-1/4" COUPLING- COPPER X COPPER Ea.
103002-14-6 3/4" COPPER TEE Ea.
103002-14-7 1" COPPER TEE Ea.
103002-14-8 11/4" COPPER TEE Ea.
103002-14-9 11/2" COPPER TEE Ea.
103002-14-10 1" X 1" X 3/4" COPPER TEE Ea.
103002-14-11 C04-33 3/4" COMPRESSION X 3/4" FEMALE IRON Ea.
103002-14-12 C44-34 1" X 3/4" COMPRESSION COUPLING Ea.
103002-14-13 MACDONALD RANGER 3/4" CONNECTOR Ea.
103002-34-2 3/4" IRON X IRON Ea.
103002-34-1 3/4" IRON X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-8 3/4" IRON X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-3 3/4" COMPRESSION X COMPRESSION Ea. 40 90.00 $3,600.00 $24.85 $994.00 $87.00 $3,480.00 $24.85 $994.00
103002-34-7 3/4" CURB STOP COPPER X COPPER FLAIRED Ea.
103002-34-9 1" IRON X IRON Ea.
103002-34-10 1" IRON X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-11 1" IRON X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-4 1" COMPRESSION X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-11 1" FLARED X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-25 1" COMPRESSION X 3/4" COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-12 11/4" IRON X IRON Ea.
103002-34-13 11/4" IRON X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-14 11/4" IRON X FLARED Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-34-15 11/4" COMPRESSION X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-16 11/4" FLARED X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-17 11/2" IRON X IRON Ea.
103002-34-18 11/2" IRON X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-19 11/2" IRON X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-20 11/2" COMPRESSION X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-5 11/2" FLARED X FLAIRED Ea.
103002-34-21 2" IRON X IRON Ea.
103002-34-22 2" IRON X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-23 2" IRON X FLARED Ea.
103002-34-6 2" COMPRESSION X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-34-24  |2" FLARED X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-11 3/4" CORPORATION ADAPTER FLARED Ea.
103002-42-14 |MED CORPORATION ADAPTER COMPRESSION Ea. 20 48.00 $960.00 $28.00 $560.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $29.10 $582.00
103002-42-16  |3/4" IRON CORPORATION STOP Ea.
103002-42-22 2" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-23 |2" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea. 2 300.00 $600.00 $320.50 $641.00 $309.00 $618.00 $321.05 $642.10
103002-42-4 3/4" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea.
103002-42-5 5/8" CC X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-42-51 5/8" X 3/4" CC X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-42-52 5/8" CC X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-6 1" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea.
103002-42-61 1" CC X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-7 1 %" CC X COMPRESSION Ea.
103002-42-71 1 %" CC X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-8 1-1/2" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea.
103002-42-81 1-1/2" CC X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-9 1-1/2" X 2" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea.
103002-42-91 1-1/2" X 2" CC X FLARED Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024

BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-42-23 2" CC X COMPRESSION CORP STOP Ea.
103002-42-17 2" CC X FLARED Ea.
103002-42-18 3/4" X 1" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-19 1" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-20 11/4" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-21 1-1/2" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-22 2" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
103002-42-23 3/4" X 3/4" IRON FOR BLOW-OFFS Ea.
11/4" ADAPTER TO CHANGE FLANGED TO
103002-42-53 COK/IPRESSION Ea.
103002-42-10 |SMALL CORPORATION ADAPTER COMPRESSION Ea. 40 45.00 $1,800.00 $28.50 $1,140.00 $78.00 $3,120.00 $80.00 $3,200.00
103002-42-13 LARGE CORPORATION ADAPTER FLARED Ea.
103002-42-14 |MED CORPORATION ADAPTER COMPRESSION Ea. 20 48.00 $960.00 $28.00 $560.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $29.10 $582.00
103002-42-15 MED CORPORATION ADAPTER FLARED Ea. 2 47.00 $94.00 $23.75 $47.50 $83.00 $166.00 $66.25 $132.50
GROUP C-SUB TOTAL $8,014.00 $3,942.50 $10,384.00 $6,132.60
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP D - DUCTILE IRON PIPE (PAGE DS - 3)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION ont | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION]| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103001-3-0 3" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-1 4" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-2 6" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-3 8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-4 10" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-5 12" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-6 16" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-7 20" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-8 24" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-9 30" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-10  [36" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-11  [42" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
103001-3-12 (48" DUCTILE IRON PIPE LF
GROUP D - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP E - FIRE HYDRANTS W/STORZ CONNECTION (PAGE DS - 10)
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
139002-6-0 4'x 67 UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea. 2 3,869.00 $7,738.00 $3,881.53 $7,763.06 $3,565.00 $7,130.00 $3,843.00 $7,686.00
OPERATING NUT
139002-6-1 > x 0" UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea. 9 3,945.00 $35,505.00 $3,958.29 $35,624.61 $3,565.00 $32,085.00 $3,919.00 $35,271.00
OPERATING NUT
139002-6-2 > x 67 UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea. 10 4,022.00 $40,220.00 $4,305.05 $43,050.50 $3,645.00 $36,450.00 $3,995.00 $39,950.00
OPERATING NUT
139002-6-3 6’ x 0” UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND OPERATING NUT Ea. 8 4,100.00 $32,800.00 $4,111.80 $32,894.40 $3,724.00 $29,792.00 $4,071.00 $32,568.00
139002-6-4 6" x 6” UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea. 5 4,170.00 $20,850.00 $4,188.56 $20,942.80 $3,803.00 $19,015.00 $4,147.00 $20,735.00
OPERATING NUT
139002-6-5 7"x 0% UTICA TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea. 2 4,250.00 $8,500.00 $4,265.32 $8,530.64 $3,882.00 $7,764.00 $4,223.00 $8,446.00
OPERATING NUT
139002-7-0 4’ x 6” WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND Ea.
WHITESTOWN OPERATING NUT
139002-7-1 5" WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND WHITESTOWN Ea.
OPERATING NUT
139002-7-2 >'x 6" WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND Ea. 2 4,022.00 $8,044.00 $4,035.05 $8,070.10 $3,645.00 $7,290.00 $3,995.00 $7,990.00
WHITESTOWN OPERATING NUT
139002-7-3 6" x 0" WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND Ea. 4 4,100.00 $16,400.00 $4,111.80 $16,447.20 $3,724.00 $14,896.00 $4,071.00 $16,284.00
WHITESTOWN OPERATING NUT
139002-7-4 6" x 6 WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND Ea. 3 4,170.00 $12,510.00 $4,188.56 $12,565.68 $3,803.00 $11,409.00 $4,147.00 $12,441.00
WHITESTOWN OPERATING NUT
139002-7-20 7' x 0" WHITESTOWN TYPE NOZZLES AND Ea. 2 4,250.00 $8,500.00 $4,265.32 $8,530.64 $3,882.00 $7,764.00 $4,223.00 $8,446.00
WHITESTOWN OPERATING NUT
139002-7-5 STORZ ADAPTERS - 5 1/4" Ea.
139002-7-6 6" HYDRANT EXTENTION 5 1/4" VO K81 Ea. 4 536.00 $2,144.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $358.00 $1,432.00 $536.00 $2,144.00
139002-7-7 12" HYDRANT EXTENTION 5 1/4" VO K81 Ea.
139002-7-8 18" HYDRANT EXTENTION 5 1/4" VO K81 Ea.
139002-7-9 24" HYDRANT EXTENTION 5 1/4" VO K81 Ea.
47234 4 1/2" Traffic Repair Kit - Clow Eddy MODEL 2640 Ea.
47236 5 1/4" Traffic Repair Kit - Clow Eddy MODEL 2640 Ea.
GROUPE - SUB TOTAL $193,211.00 $196,619.63 $175,027.00 $191,961.00
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP F - FIRE HYDRANT PARTS & FITTINGS (PAGE DS - 10)
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION uniT | QTy UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)

103003-4-1 11/2" x 2" BRASS NIPPLE "SHORT NIPPLE" Ea.
103003-4-2 11/2" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103003-4-3 :FZ/;;IE;QS;;ZI;ING CHECK VALVE Ea.
103003-4-4 11/2" BRASS GATE VALVE (Female/Female) Ea.
103003-4-5 21/2"FNSTx11/2" M IPT ADAPTER Ea.
103003-4-6 21/2"FUTICAx11/2" M IPT ADAPTER Ea.
139002-7-5 STORZ ADAPTERS - 5" Ea.
139002-7-11 2 1/2" NOZZLE CAP GASKET Ea.

GROUP F - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

COREY PARTS

393-0225 Operating Arms Ea.
393-0245 Gate Plate Ea.
393-0270 Gate Washer Ea.
393-0255 Gate Rubber Ea.
393-0784 Gate Bolt Ea.
393-0790 Gate Nut Ea.
392-0115 Upper Coupling Ea.
393-0285 Lower Coupling Ea.
393-0290 Gate Cotter Pin Ea.
393-0295 Gate Pin Long Ea.
393-0301 Gate Pin Short Ea.
392-0120 Coupling Pin Ea.
393-0300 Drip Valve Rubber Ea.
393-0345 Drip Valve Washer Ea.
393-0350 Drip Valve Bolt Ea.
393-0486 Collar Ea. 1 $40.00 $40.00
393-0482 Collar Set Screws Ea. 1 $2.75 $2.75
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
393-0325 Brass Drip Valve Holder Ea. 2 $113.50 $227.00
393-0200 Bronze Threaded Spindle Ea. 1 $0.00
392-0121 Gate Rubber Ea. 2 $0.00
392-0122 Retaining Plate Ea. 1 $0.00
47234 4 1/2" Traffic Repair Kit - Clow Eddy Ea. 10 $191.50 $1,915.00
47236 5 1/4" Traffic Repair Kit - Clow Eddy Ea. 5 $191.50 $957.50
GROUP F1 - SUB TOTAL NO BID $3,142.25 NO BID NO BID
KENNEDY PARTS
K8101 Alemite Grease Fitting Ea.
K8102 Operating Stem Nut Ea.
K8103 Dirt Shield Ea.
K8104 Stem Lock Nut O-Ring Ea.
K8105 O-Ring - Viton Ea.
K8106 Thrust Washer Ea.
K8107 Hydrant Cap/Bonnet Ea.
K8108 Cap Bolts & Nuts Ea.
K8109 Cap Gasket Ea.
K8110 Stem Ferrule Ea.
K8111 O-Ring - Bun-N Ea.
K8112 Bronze Stem Sleeve O-Ring Ea.
K8114 Upper Stem Ea.
K8115 Upper Barrel/Nozzle Section Ea.
K8116 Stem Break Coupling Ea.
K8118 Bolts & Nuts For Break Flange Ea.
K8119 Breaking Ring Ea.
K8120 O-Ring for Break Flange Ea.
K8122R Coupling Pins Ea.
K8123 Lower Stem Ea.
K8124 Lower Baael Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
K8125 Elbow O-Ring Gasket Ea.
K8126A Seat Ring Upper O-Ring Ea.
K8127 Seat Ring Insert/Retainer Ring Ea.
K8128 Seat Ring Ea.
K8130 O-Ring - Bun-N Ea.
K8131 Main Valve Ea.
K8137 Drain Valve Facing W/Insert Ea.
K8141 Nozzle Retaining Screw Ea.
K8142U Nozzle - UTICA Ea.
K8142wW Nozzle - WHITESTOWN Ea.
K8143 Nozzle Cap Gasket Ea.
K8144 Nozzle Cap Ea.
K8145 O-Ring - Bun-N Ea.
K8149 Collision Repair Kit - 4.5" Ea.
K8150 Collision Repair Kit - 5.5" Ea.
GROUP F2 - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HYDRANT METER PARTS
139002-7-10 11/2" Brass Coupling Ea.
139002-7-11 11/2" Brass Gate Valves Ea.
139002-7-12 2" Brass Nipple Ea.
139002-7-13 3" Brass Nipple Ea.
139002-7-14 2 1/2" Female UTICA to 2 1/2" Male NST adapter Brg§  Ea.

Hydrant Markers - 4' x 3/8" fiberglass shaft
138002735 | o s wih saness et s | £

and hardware. Need to see cut sheet for bid

GROUP F3 - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP G - LEAD PACK ADAPTORS (PAGE DS - 5)
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT | QTY
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)

103007-283-6 28-13 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea. 5 16.00 $80.00 $20.50 $102.50 $0.00 $0.00 $21.50 $107.50
103007-283-1 28-23 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-283-2 28-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-143-1 14-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-243-1 24-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-243-2 24-23 COUPLING Ea.
103007-342-4 24-23 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-342-3 34-23 COPPER X IRON LEAD PACK CONNECTOR Ea.
103007-383-6 38-13 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-383-7 38-23 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea. 5 38.00 $190.00 $36.50 $182.50 $0.00 $0.00 $39.00 $195.00
103007-383-9 38-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-443-3 44-33 COPPER X IRON LEAD PACK CONNECTOR Ea.
103007-443-4 44-34 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-223-3 22-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-463-3 46-33 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-341-3 34-13 LEAD PACK ADAPTOR Ea.
103007-243-3 3/4" PHILMAC UNIV. PLASTIC COUPLING Ea.
103007-243-4 1" PHILMAC UNIV. PLASTIC COUPLING Ea.

GROUP G - SUB TOTAL $270.00 $285.00 NO BID $302.50
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP H - MECHANICAL JOINT BENDS/CAPS/CROSSES/REDUCERS/SLEEVES/FITTINGS/TEES (PAGE DS - 3)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION onit | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103002-2-1 4" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-2 6" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-3 8" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-4 10" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-5 12" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-6 16" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-7 20" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-8 24" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-9 30" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-2-10 34" MECHANICAL JOINT CAP Ea.
103002-5-7 6" X 45 BEND Ea. 6 $187.50 $1,125.00 $88.00 $528.00 $171.25 $1,027.50
103002-5-4 4" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-9 6" X 11.25 BEND Ea. 2 $183.50 $367.00 $84.00 $168.00 $167.50 $335.00
103002-5-8 6" X 90 BEND Ea. 1 $208.50 $208.50 $108.00 $108.00 $189.50 $189.50
103002-5-12 8" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-16 10" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-20 12" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-24 16" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-28 20" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-32 24" X 90 BEND Ea.
103002-5-3 4" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-7 6" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-11 8" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-15 10" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-19 12" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-23 16" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-27 20" X 45 BEND Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-5-31 24" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-2 4" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-6 6" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-10 8" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-18 10" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-1 12" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-0 16" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-33 20" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-35 24" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-41 36" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-5 4" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-9 6" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-17 8" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-14 10" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-13 12" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-40 16" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-34 20" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-36 24" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-37 30" X 11.25 BEND Ea.
103002-5-30 30" X 22.5 BEND Ea.
103002-5-38 30" X 45 BEND Ea.
103002-5-39 30" X 90 BEND Ea.
TEES
103002-8-1 4"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-2 6"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-3 6"X6" TEE Ea. 3 $305.50 $916.50 $155.00 $465.00 $278.00 $834.00
103002-8-4 8"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-5 8"X6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-6 8"X8" TEE Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-8-7 10"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-8 10"X6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-9 10"X8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-10 10"X10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-11 12"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-12 12"X6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-13 12"X8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-14 12"X10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-15 12"X12" TEE Ea.
103002-8-16 16"X4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-17 16"X6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-18 16"X8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-19 16"X10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-20 16"X12" TEE Ea.
103002-8-21 16"X16" TEE Ea.
103002-8-33 20"x4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-23 20"x6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-34 20"x8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-35 20"x10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-36 20"x12" TEE Ea.
103002-8-37 20"x16" TEE Ea.
103002-8-38 20"x20" TEE Ea.
103002-8-39 24"x4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-40 24"x6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-41 24"x8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-42 24"x10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-43 24"x12" TEE Ea.
103002-8-44 24"x16" TEE Ea.
103002-8-45 24"x20" TEE Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-8-24 24"x24" TEE Ea.
103002-8-46 30"x4" TEE Ea.
103002-8-47 30"x6" TEE Ea.
103002-8-48 30"x8" TEE Ea.
103002-8-49 30"x10" TEE Ea.
103002-8-50 30"x12" TEE Ea.
103002-8-51 30"x16" TEE Ea.
103002-8-52 30"x20" TEE Ea.
103002-8-30 30"x24" TEE Ea.
103002-8-53 30"x30" TEE Ea.
103002-8-31 6"X6" Anchor TEE Ea.
103002-8-32 8"X6" Anchor TEE Ea.
103002-8-56 8"X8" Anchor TEE Ea.
103002-8-54 12"X6" Anchor TEE Ea.
103002-8-55 20"X6" Anchor TEE Ea.
103002-9-4 8" x 6" REDUCER Ea. 3 $209.50 $628.50 $92.00 $276.00 $190.50 $571.50
103002-9-7 10"X8" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-8 12"X4" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-9 12"X6" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-10 12"X8" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-11 12"X10" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-12 16"X4" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-13 16"x6" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-14 16"x8" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-15 16"x10" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-16 16"X12" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-17 20"X4" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-18 20'X6" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-19 20"X8" REDUCER Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-9-20 20"X10" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-21 20"X12" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-22 20"X16" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-23 24"X4" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-36 24"X6" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-25 24"X8" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-26 24"X10" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-27 24"X12" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-28 24"X16" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-29 24"X20" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-30 30"X4" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-31 30"X6" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-32 30"X8" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-33 30"X10" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-34 30"X12" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-35 30"X16" REDUCER Ea.
103002-9-24 30"X24" REDUCER Ea.
16" MECHANICAL JOINT SOLID SLEEVE (12"
103004-0-16 LENGTH) ( Ea.
20" MECHANICAL JOINT SOLID SLEEVE (12"
103004-0-20 LENGTH) ( Ea.
24" MECHANICAL JOINT SOLID SLEEVE (12"
103004-0-24 LENGTH) ( Ea.
103004-0-25 8" x 6" MECHANICAL JOINT CROSS Ea.
103004-0-26 6" x 6" MECHANICAL JOINT CROSS Ea.
103004-0-27 20" X 16" MECHANICAL JOINT CROSS Ea.
30" MECHANICAL JOINT SOLID SLEEVE (12"
103004-0-30 LENGTH) ( Ea.
36" MECHANICAL JOINT SOLID SLEEVE (12"
103004-0-36 LENGTH) ( Ea.
FOSTER ADAPTERS
103007-0-4 4" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-6 6" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea. 8 $101.75 $814.00 $128.00 $1,024.00 $119.25 $954.00
103007-0-8 8" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea. 1 $147.50 $147.50 $167.00 $167.00 $156.00 $156.00
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY

103007-0-10 10" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-12 12" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-16 16" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-20 20" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-24 24" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.
103007-0-30 30" Foster Adapter with Kit Ea.

GASKETS - LOCKING

4" FIELD-LOK GASKETS PUSH ON Ea
103006-0-4 )

6" FIELD-LOK GASKETS PUSH ON Ea
103006-0-6 )

8" FIELD-LOK GASKETS PUSH ON Ea
103006-0-8 )

10" FIELD-LOK GASKETS PUSH ON Ea
103006-0-10 )

12" FIELD-LOK GASKETS PUSH ON Ea
103006-0-12 )

GROUP H - SUB TOTAL NO BID $4,207.00 $2,736.00 $4,067.50
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY

GROUP | - QUICK TAPS

UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION]| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT | QT

(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103012-3-1 4" X 3/4" Ea.
103012-3-2 4" X 1" Ea.
103012-3-3 6" X 3/4" Ea.
103012-3-4 6"X1" Ea.
103012-3-5 8" X 3/4" Ea.
103012-3-6 8" X 1" Ea.
103012-3-7 10" X 3/4" Ea.
103012-3-8 10" X 1" Ea.
103012-3-9 12" X 3/4" Ea.
103012-3-10  [12"X1" Ea.

GROUP | - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP J - RETAINER GLANDS (PAGE DS - 3)
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT | aTy
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)

103202-1-1 4" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-2 6" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-3 8" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-4 10" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-5 12" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-6 16" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-7 20" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-8 24" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG Ea.

103002-1-20  [4" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG W/ 2" TAP Ea.

103002-1-21  |6" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG W/ 2" TAP Ea.

103002-1-22  [8" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG W/2" TAP Ea.

103002-1-23  [10" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG W/ 2" TAP Ea.

103002-1-24  [12" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUG W/ 2" TAP Ea.

MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND KIT COMPLETE

103002-3-1 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 4" Ea.

103002-3-2 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 6" Ea. 75 58.00 $4,350.00 $50.25 $3,768.75 $50.00 $3,750.00 $46.75 $3,506.25
103002-3-3 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 8" Ea. 1 73.00 $73.00 $68.25 $68.25 $66.00 $66.00 $65.50 $65.50
103002-3-4 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 10" Ea.

103002-3-5 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 12" Ea.

103002-3-6 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 20" Ea.

103002-3-7 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 24" Ea.

103002-3-8 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 30" Ea.

103002-3-19  |MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 36" Ea.

103002-3-18  |MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 16" Ea.

MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND ONLY

103002-3-0 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 3" Ea.

103002-3-9 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 4" Ea.

103002-3-10  |MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 6" Ea.

103002-3-11  [MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 8" Ea.

103002-3-12  [MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 10" Ea.

103002-3-13  [MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 12" Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-3-17 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 16" Ea.
103002-3-14 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 20" Ea.
103002-3-15 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 24" Ea.
103002-3-16 MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAND 30" Ea.
ACCESSORY RUBBER GASKETS & BOLT PACKS
103002-4-0 3" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-1 4" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-2 6" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-3 8" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-4 10" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-5 12" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-6 16" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-7 20" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-8 24" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
103002-4-9 30" ACCESSORY PACKS Ea.
GROUP J - SUB TOTAL $4,423.00 $3,837.00 $3,816.00 $3,571.75
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP K - CLAMPS (PAGES DS - 1 and DS - 2)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION ont | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103003-10-4  |4" BELLJOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-6  |6" BELLJOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-8  |8" BELLJOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-10  |10" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-12  |12" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-16  |16" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-20  |20" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-24  [24" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-30  [30" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
103003-10-36  |36" BELL JOINT CLAMP Ea.
CLAMPS

103003-30-1  [3"X7.5" WIDE (2.97-3.25) OD Ea.
103003-30-2  [3"X7.5" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD Ea.
103003-30-3  [3"X7.5" WIDE (3.96-4.25) OD Ea.
103003-30-4  [3"X12.5" WIDE (3.46-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-5  [3"X12.5" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD Ea.
103003-30-6  [3"X15" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD Ea.
103003-30-21  [3"X15" WIDE (3.46-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-22  [3"X7.5" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.46-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-8  [3"X 7 1/2" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.73-4.00) OD Ea.
103003-30-9  [3"X 12 1/2" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.73-4.00) OD Ea.
103003-30-12  [3"X7 1/2" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.73-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-23  [3"X12 1/2" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.46-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-13  [3"X12 1/2" WIDE 3/4" TAP (3.73-3.70) OD Ea.
103003-30-14  [3"X 12 1/2" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD 1" TAP Ea.
103003-30-10  [3"X 7.5" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD 1" TAP Ea.
103003-30-11  [3"X7.5" WIDE (3.46-3.70) OD Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103003-30-15 3"X 12 1/2" WIDE (3.73-4.00) OD 1" TAP Ea.
103003-30-16 10"X 7 1/2" WIDE (10.75-11.10) OD HDPE PLASTIC Ea.
103003-30-17 10"X 12 1/2" WIDE (10.75-11.10) OD HDPE PLASTIC| Ea.
103003-30-18  [6"X 7 1/2" WIDE (5.95-6.35) OD Ea.
103003-30-24  |6"X 10" WIDE (6.56-6.96) OD Ea.
103003-30-25 6"X 10" WIDE 3/4" TAP (6.56-6.96) OD Ea.
103003-30-19  |8"X 10" WIDE (8.53-8.91) OD Ea.
103003-30-20 12"X 15" WIDE 3/4" TAP (12.10-12.50) OD Ea.
CLAMPS (OVERSIZED)
103003-31-1 4" X7 1/2" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD Ea.
103003-31-2 4" X7 1/2" WIDE (5.22-5.62) OD Ea.
103003-31-53  |4" X 10" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD Ea.
103003-31-3 4" X 12 1/2" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD Ea.
103003-31-4 4" X 12 1/2" WIDE (5.22-5.62) OD Ea.
103003-31-5 4" X 15 1/2" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD Ea.
103003-31-6 4" X 15 1/2" WIDE (5.22-5.62) OD Ea.
103003-31-7 4" X 12 1/2" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-8 4"X121/2" WIDE (4.74-5.57) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-9 4" X 121/2" WIDE (5.22-5.62) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-10 (4" X 12 1/2" WIDE (5.22-5.62) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-11 (6" X 7 1/2" WIDE (6.84-7.64) OD Ea. 2 $ 138.00 $276.00 $89.25 $178.50 $88.00 $176.00 $163.25 $326.50
103003-31-12 6" X 12 1/2" WIDE (6.84-7.64) OD Ea.
103003-31-13 6" X 15" WIDE (6.84-7.64) OD Ea.
103003-31-14 (6" X 12 1/2" WIDE (6.84-7.64) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-15 6" X 12 1/2" WIDE (6.84-7.64) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-16 (8" X 7 1/2" WIDE (9.27-9.67) OD Ea.
103003-31-17  [8" X 12 1/2" WIDE (9.27-9.67) OD Ea.
103003-31-18  |8" X 15" WIDE (9.27-9.67) OD Ea.
103003-31-52 (8" X 12 1/2" WIDE (8.62-9.42) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103003-31-19 (8" X 12 1/2" WIDE (9.27-9.67) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-20 (8" X 12 1/2" WIDE (9.27-9.67) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-21 10" X7 1/2" (11.60-12.40) OD Ea.
103003-31-51 10" X 10" (11.75-12.15) OD Ea.
103003-31-22 10" X 12 1/2" (11.60-12.40) OD Ea.
103003-31-23 10" X 12 1/2" (11.75-12.15) OD Ea.
103003-31-24 10" X 15" (11.60-12.40) OD Ea.
103003-31-50 10" X 20" (11.75-12.15) OD Ea.
103003-31-25 10" X 12 1/2" (11.60-12.40) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea. 2 $ 317.00 $634.00 $189.50 $379.00 $186.00 $372.00 $467.75 $935.50
103003-31-26 10" X 12 1/2" (11.60-12.40) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-27 10" X7 1/2" (11.75-12.15) OD Ea.
103003-31-28 10" X 15" (11.75-12.15) OD Ea.
103003-31-29 10" X 12 1/2" (11.75-12.15) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-30 10" X 12 1/2" (11.75-12.15) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-31 12" X7 1/2" (13.65-14.45) OD Ea.
103003-31-49 12" X 10" (12.75-13.55) OD Ea.
103003-31-32 12" X 12 1/2" (13.65-14.45) OD Ea.
103003-31-33 12" X 15" (13.65-14.45) OD Ea.
103003-31-34 12" X 12 1/2" (13.65-14.45) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-35 12" X 12 1/2" (13.65-14.45) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-36 12" X7 1/2" (13.20-14.00) OD Ea.
103003-31-37 12" X 12 1/2" (13.20-14.00) OD Ea.
103003-31-38 12" X 12 1/2" (13.20-14.00) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-39 12" X 12 1/2" (13.20-14.00) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
103003-31-40 10" X7 1/2" (11.34-11.74) OD Ea.
103003-31-41 10" X 12 1/2" (11.34-11.74) OD Ea.
103003-31-42 10" X 15" (11.34-11.74) OD Ea.
103003-31-43 10" X 121/2" (11.34-11.74) OD W/ 3/4" TAP Ea.
103003-31-44 10" X 121/2" (11.34-11.74) OD W/ 1" TAP Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103003-31-55 12" X 15" (13.20-14.00) OD Ea.
103003-31-48  |22" X 5" POWERSEAL Ea.
CLAMPS (SPECIAL)
103003-31-45 2" X7 1/2" WIDE (2.35-2.65) OD GALVANIZED Ea.
103003-31-46 (2" X 12 1/2" WIDE (2.35-2.65) OD GALVANIZED Ea.
103003-31-47  |2" X 15" WIDE (2.35-2.65) OD GALVANIZED Ea.
REPAIR CLAMPS
103012-46-7 4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-46-12  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-46-15  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-46-20  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-46-25  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 25" wide Ea.
103012-66-7 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea. 50 79.00 $3,950.00 $89.25 $4,462.50 $75.00 $3,750.00 $105.25 $5,262.50
103012-66-12  |6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea. 25 125.00 $3,125.00 $114.25 $2,856.25 $112.00 $2,800.00 $174.50 $4,362.50
103012-66-15 |6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea. 20 145.00 $2,900.00 $134.25 $2,685.00 $132.00 $2,640.00 $203.50 $4,070.00
103012-66-20  |6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea. 10 214.00 $2,140.00 $188.50 $1,885.00 $185.00 $1,850.00 $293.25 $2,932.50
103012-66-25 |6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea. 10 255.00 $2,550.00 $242.50 $2,425.00 $238.00 $2,380.00 $356.25 $3,562.50
103012-86-7 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea. 30 91.00 $2,730.00 $89.25 $2,677.50 $88.00 $2,640.00 $126.50 $3,795.00
103012-86-12  |8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-86-15  |8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-86-20  |8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-86-25  |8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-06-7 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-06-12 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-06-15 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-06-20 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-06-25 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-26-7 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-26-39 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 10" wide Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103012-26-12 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-26-15 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-26-20 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-26-25 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-26-26 16" REPAIR CLAMPS - 10" wide Ea.
103012-26-27 16" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-26-16 16" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-26-28 16" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-26-29 16" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-26-38 18" REPAIR CLAMPS - 10" wide Ea.
103012-26-30  |20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 10" wide Ea.
103012-26-31 20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-26-17  |20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-26-32 20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-26-33 20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-26-41 20" REPAIR CLAMPS - 30" wide Ea.
103012-26-34  |24" REPAIR CLAMPS - 10" wide Ea.
103012-26-35 24" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-26-18  |24" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-26-36  |24" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-26-37  |24" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-26-40  |30" REPAIR CLAMPS - 30" wide Ea.
REPAIR CLAMPS STYLE 3/4" TAP
103012-48-7 4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-48-12  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-48-15  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-48-20  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-48-25  |4" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-68-7 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103012-68-12 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-68-15 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-68-20 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-68-24 6" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-88-7 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-88-12 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-88-15 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-88-20 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-88-24 8" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-08-7 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2 " wide Ea.
103012-08-12 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-08-15 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-08-20 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-08-24 10" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-28-7 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-28-12 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-28-15 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-28-20 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-28-24 12" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
REPAIR CLAMPS STYLE 1" TAP

103012-49-7 4"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-49-12 4"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-49-15 4"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-49-20 4"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-49-24 4"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-69-7 6"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-69-12 6"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-69-15 6"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.

Ea.

103012-69-20

6"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103012-69-24 6"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-88-0 8"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-88-1 8"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-88-5 8"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-88-2 8"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-88-3 8"X1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-10-7 10"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS -7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-10-8 10"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-10-9 10"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-10-10 10"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-10-11 10"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
103012-12-7 12"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 7 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-12-12 12"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 12 1/2" wide Ea.
103012-12-13 12"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 15" wide Ea.
103012-12-14 12"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 20" wide Ea.
103012-12-15 12"x1" REPAIR CLAMPS - 24" wide Ea.
SADDLES & SERVICES

" , Ea.
103013-2-1 4"X3/4

" . Ea.
103013-2-2 4" X1

" " Ea.
103013-2-3 4"X11/4

" " Ea.
103013-2-4 4"X11/2

"y gn Ea.
103013-2-5 4"X2

" \ Ea.
103013-2-6 6" X3/4

" | Ea.
103013-2-7 6" X1

" | . ; Ea.
103013-2-26 6" X 1' Plastic Main

" " Ea.
103013-2-8 6"X11/4

" " Ea.
103013-2-9 6"X11/2
103013-2-10  |6" X 2" Ea.

" , Ea.
103013-2-11 8"X3/4
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
n 1 Ea.
103013-2-12 8" X1
n n Ea'
103013-2-13 8"X11/4
n " Ea.
103013-2-14 8"X11/2
n n Ea'
103013-2-15 8" X2
" ' Ea.
103013-2-16 10" X 3/4
103013-2-17 10" X 1' Ea.
" n Ea.
103013-2-18 10"X11/4
" " Ea.
103013-2-19 10"X11/2
"y o Ea.
103013-2-20 10" X 2
" ! Ea.
103013-2-21 12" X 3/4
Wyt Ea.
103013-2-22 12" X1
" " Ea.
103013-2-23 12"X11/4
" " Ea.
103013-2-24 12"X11/2
Wy gn Ea.
103013-2-25 12" X2
" " Ea.
103013-2-27 24" X 1.5
GROUP K - SUB TOTAL $18,305.00 $17,548.75 $16,608.00 $25,247.00
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP L - TAPPING SLEEVES (PAGE DS - 2)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION ont | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION]| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103002-12-28  |4"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-06  |6"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-8  |8"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-10  [10"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-12  [12"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-16  |16"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-17  |6"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-18  |8"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-19  [10"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-20  |12"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea. 1 720.00 $720.00 $750.00 $750.00 $989.00 $989.00 $945.50 $945.50
103002-12-21  |16"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-22  |8"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-23  [10"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-11  [10"X10" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE (11.70-12.10) Ea.
103002-12-24  [12"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-29  |12"X10" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-30  [12"X12" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-25  |16"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-31  [16"X10" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-32  [16"X12" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-33  [16"X16" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-34  [20"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-35  [20"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-27  [20"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-36  [20"X10" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-37  [20"X12" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-38  [20"X16" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103002-12-39  |20"X20" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-40  |24"X4" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-41  |24"X6" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-42 24"X8" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-43 24"X10" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-44  |24"X12" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-45 24"X16" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-46  |24"X20" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
103002-12-47  |24"X24" STEEL TAPPING SLEEVE Ea.
GROUP L - SUB TOTAL $720.00 $750.00 $989.00 $945.50

Page 22 - 33




MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY

MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP M - GATE VALVES (PAGES DS - 7 and DS - 8)
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION| UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT | aTy
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103012.4.2 2" VERTICAL RESILIENTWEDGE GATE VALVE - OPEN [ -
LEFT
103012.4.3 3" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE- OPEN [ -
RIGHT
103012-4-5 4" FLANGE VALVE Ea.
103012.4.4 4" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE- OPEN [ -
RIGHT
6" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE -
103012-4-6 OPEN RIGHT Ea. a |s 985.00 $3,940.00 $992.25 $3,969.00 $950.00 $3,800.00 $992.50 $3,970.00
8" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE -
103012-4-8 OPEN RIGHT Ea. 1 |s 1,590.00 $1,590.00 $1,581.25 $1,581.25 $1,512.00 $1,512.00 $1,581.00 $1,581.00
103012.4.00 | 10" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE - o
OPEN RIGHT
103012.4.07 | 12" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE - o
OPEN RIGHT
103012.4.06 | 16" VERTICAL RESILIENT WEDGE GATE VALVE - o
OPEN RIGHT
103012-4-20  |20" HORIZONTAL GATE VALVE Ea.
103012-4-24  [24" HORIZONTAL GATE VALVE Ea.
103012-5-6 6" BUTTERFLY VALVE - OPEN RIGHT Ea.
103012-5-16  |16" BUTTERFLY VALVE - OPEN RIGHT Ea.
103012-5-20  |20" BUTTERFLY VALVE - OPEN RIGHT Ea.
103012-5-24  |24" BUTTERFLY VALVE - OPEN RIGHT Ea.
103012-5-30  |30" BUTTERFLY VALVE - OPEN RIGHT Ea.
103012-5-36  |36" BUTTERFLY VALVE MECHANICAL JOINT Ea.
103012-5-25  |24" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT GATE VALVE Ea.
4" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE -
103012-6-4 Ea.
OPEN RIGHT
6" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE -
103012-6-6 OPEN RIGHT Ea. 1 | 1,395.00 $1,395.00 $1,385.75 $1,385.75 $1,325.00 $1,325.00 $1,386.00 $1,386.00
8" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE -
103012-6-8 Ea.
OPEN RIGHT
10" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE -
103012-6-10 Ea.
OPEN RIGHT
103012.6.17 | 12" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE - Ea
OPEN RIGHT
16" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE -
103012-6-13 Ea.
OPEN RIGHT
103012.6.14 | 20" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE - s
OPEN RIGHT :
103012.6.15 | 24" VERTICAL RESILIENT SEAT TAPPING VALVE - .
OPEN RIGHT :
GROUP M - SUB TOTAL $6,925.00 $6,936.00 $6,637.00 $6,937.00
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP N - VALVE BOXES and CURB BOXES (PAGE DS - 6)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION ont | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
CURB BOX

103002-35-9  |CURB BOX EXTENSIONS 9" Ea. 30 15.50 $465.00 $15.50 $465.00 $15.00 $450.00 $16.75 $502.50
103002-35-16  |CURB BOX EXTENSIONS 16" Ea. 30 21.50 $645.00 $22.00 $660.00 $20.00 $600.00 $20.25 $607.50
103002-35-24  |24” TOP SECTION CURB BOX Ea. 150 34.00 $5,100.00 $29.75 $4,462.50 $28.00 $4,200.00 $29.25 $4,387.50
103002-35-40  [30” TOP SECTION CURB BOX Ea.

103002-35-41  |40” BOTTOM CURB BOX Ea.

103002-35-42  |CURB BOX OVERSIZED BOTTOM Ea.

103021-11-1  |1” CURB BOX REPAIR COVER w/2 HOLES Ea.

103021-11-3 |2 %” CURB BOX REPAIR OUTSIDE Ea. 50 24.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.00 $850.00 $11.75 $587.50
103021-11-4 |2 %4” CURB BOX REPAIR INSIDE Ea.

VALVE BOXES

103021-10-22  (VALVE BOX TOP SECTION - 16" Ea. 50 34.00 $1,700.00 $33.75 $1,687.50 $32.00 $1,600.00 $38.50 $1,925.00
103021-10-3  |VALVE BOX 2' TOP SECTION - 26" Ea. 100 57.00 $5,700.00 $58.50 $5,850.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $53.25 $5,325.00
103021-10-4  |VALVE BOX 1' BOTTOM SECTION Ea.

103021-10-5  |VALVE BOX 2' BOTTOM SECTION Ea.

103021-10-6  |VALVE BOX 2' 6" BOTTOM SECTION - 30" Ea. 30 50.00 $1,500.00 $51.25 $1,537.50 $53.00 $1,590.00 $60.75 $1,822.50
103021-10-7  |VALVE BOX 3' BOTTOM SECTION Ea. 50 56.00 $2,800.00 $56.75 $2,837.50 $63.00 $3,150.00 $71.50 $3,575.00
103021-10-8  |VALVE BOX CAPS Ea. 100 15.00 $1,500.00 $16.50 $1,650.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00
103021-10-9  |VALVE BOX 1" RISER Ea. 150 14.00 $2,100.00 $11.50 $1,725.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $19.00 $2,850.00
103021-10-10  |VALVE BOX 1.5" RISER Ea. 100 19.00 $1,900.00 $15.25 $1,525.00 $14.00 $1,400.00 $24.75 $2,475.00
103021-10-11  |VALVE BOX 2" RISER Ea. 100 21.00 $2,100.00 $18.50 $1,850.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 $24.75 $2,475.00
103021-10-12  |VALVE BOX 3" RISER Ea. 50 22.00 $1,100.00 $24.50 $1,225.00 $26.00 $1,300.00 $33.25 $1,662.50
103021-10-13  |VALVE BOX 4" RISER Ea. 75 24.00 $1,800.00 $37.50 $2,812.50 $36.00 $2,700.00 $35.00 $2,625.00
103021-10-14  |VALVE BOX 6" RISER Ea. 60 129.00 $7,740.00 $42.25 $2,535.00 $39.00 $2,340.00 $38.50 $2,310.00
103021-10-15  |CAP WITH RUBBER GASKET Ea.

103021-10-16  VALVE BOX ROUND BASE - 12" Ea. 100 56.00 $5,600.00 $61.25 $6,125.00 $57.00 $5,700.00 $71.00 $7,100.00
103021-10-17  |VALVE BOX OVAL BASE Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103021-10-18 |VALVE BOX RIGHT HEIGHT Ea. 125 79.00 $9,875.00 $54.50 $6,812.50 $51.00 $6,375.00 $52.75 $6,593.75
103021-10-19 |LARGE BOTTOM SECTIO Ea. 10 88.00 $880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $166.00 $1,660.00 $187.75 $1,877.50
103021-10-20  |LARGE TOP SECTION Ea.
103021-10-21  |LARGE CAP
GROUP N - SUB TOTAL $53,705.00 $43,760.00 $44,365.00 $50,201.25
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP O - BLOW-OFF FITTINGS (PAGE DS -6)
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION ont | ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)

103008-2-1 2" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-2 2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-3 2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-4 2" X 8" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-5 2" X 10" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-6 2" X 12" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-28  [2" X 20" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-29  |2" BRASS BALL VALVE Ea.
103008-2-7 2" BRASS COUPLINGS Ea.
103008-2-8 2" STREET EL BRASS Ea.
103008-2-9 2" 45 DEGREE BRASS Ea.
103008-2-10  |2" 90 DEGREE BRASS Ea.
103008-2-33  [2" BRASS CLOSE NIPPLE 2" LONG Ea.
103008-2-30  [2" GALVANIZED NIPPLE 2" LONG Ea.
103008-2-31  |2" GALVANIZED PIPE Ea.
103008-2-11  [2" X 3" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-12  [2" X 4" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-13  [2" X 6" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-14  [2" X 8" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-15  [2" X 10" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-16  [2" X 12" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-17  [2" X 16" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-32  [2" X 18" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-18  [2" X 20" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-19  [2" X 24" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-20  [2" X 30" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-21  [2" X 36" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN EJ PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
103008-2-22 2" X 48" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-23 2" X 60" GALVANIZED NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-24 2" GALVANIZED COUPLING Ea.
103008-2-25 2" STREET EL GALVANIZED Ea.
103008-2-26 2" 45 DEGREE GALVANIZED Ea.
103008-2-27 2" GALVANIZED 90 DEGREE BEND Ea.
103008-2-28 2" X 20" BRASS NIPPLE Ea.
103008-2-29 2" BRASS BALL VALVES Ea.
103008-2-30 2" GALVANIZED NIPPLE 2" LONG Ea.
103008-2-31 2" GALVANIZED PIPE Ea.
GROUP O - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MOHAWK VALLEY WATER AUTHORITY
MATERIALS CONTRACT - 2024
BREAKDOWN CANVASS OF BIDS

BLAIR SUPPLY CORP. CORE & MAIN E J PRESCOTT F. W. WEBB COMPANY
GROUP P - SDR PLASTIC SEWER PIPE (PAGE DS -?)
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT QTyY
(IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES) (IN FIGURES)
103002-7-35 4" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-36 6" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-37 8" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-38 10" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-39 12" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-40 15" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-49 18" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-41 24" PIPE Ea.
103002-7-42 4" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
103002-7-48 8" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
103002-7-43 12" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
103002-7-44 15" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
103002-7-45 30" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
103002-7-46 20" CORROGATED (Plastic) Ea.
GROUP P - SUB TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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